
2015 AYC RACING CALENDAR 
 

 
 

Regattas & Interclub Racing 

M.I.R.C. Wednesdays – 
June to Mid- Aug 

Maine inter-club racing series at various locations – Opti & 420 race team members 

Area A – Double 
Handed Qualifier 

July 6-7, Prout’s 
Neck  

AYC will send a select group of 420 sailors to this regional double-handed 
competition.  Volunteer help will be needed to assist in transport of sailors to and 
from the regatta.  

Dead Fish 
Regatta 

July 10, Mendum’s 
Pond, UNH 

AYC Race team members will participate in a day of racing.  Volunteer help will be 
needed to assist in transport of sailors, boats and equipment to and from the 
regatta. 

U.S. Sailing 
Junior Olympic 
Sailing Festival 

July 13-15 
Camden, ME 

AYC will send a select group of our sailors to this regional competition in Optimist 
dinghies, Club 420’s and Lasers. Volunteer help will be needed to assist in transport 
of sailors, boats and equipment to and from the regatta. 

Team Race 
Champs 

July 17, Mendum’s 
Pond, UNH 

AYC will send a select group of sailors to compete in the team championships.  
Volunteer help will be needed to assist in transport of sailors to and from the 
regatta. 

Optimist Regatta 
(July) 

Saturday, July 18 
10am  

Opti racing for our newer sailors. Awards and refreshments will follow the racing.  
Spectators wanted!  

Marblehead 
Junior Race 
Week 

July 20-22 
Marblehead Race 
Week, Pleon YC 

AYC will send a select group of our best sailors to these regional competitions in 
Optimists, Club 420’s and Lasers. Volunteer help will be needed to assist in 
transport of sailors, boats and equipment to and from the regatta. 

DEJSA 420 
Championship 

August 3-4  
TBA 

AYC will send a select group of our sailors to this regional competition in Club 
420’s. Volunteer help will be needed to assist in transport of sailors, boats and 
equipment to and from the regatta. 

Maine State Opti 
Championship 

August 11-12  
Southport Yacht 
Club 

AYC will send a select group of sailors to this regional competition in Optimist 
dinghies. Volunteer help will be needed to assist in transport of sailors, boats and 
equipment to and from the regatta. 

Optimist Regatta 
(August) 

Saturday, Aug. 15 
10am  

This is the second Opti Regatta for our newer sailors. Spectators wanted!  

Adult Sailing Clinic 
Adult Sailing 
Clinic 
(June) 

Sunday, June 28 
2:30pm 

Whether you’ve never sailed or you’re feeling a little rusty, here’s your chance to get 
comfortable with our J-22’s.  You will get to know these great mini-cruisers from 
stem to stern in a hands-on afternoon of instruction and sailing. 

Fun Races for All Families and Boats 

York River 
Adventure 

Sunday, July 5   
12pm  

All classes of boats, and anything else that floats, will head up the York River for a 
family adventure. Check the Club bulletin board for full details.  

Race to the 
Nubble & Back  

Sunday, August 30 
12pm  
 

End of summer “free for all” fun race to Nubble and back. JY’s, J-22’s, 420’s, 
Lasers, or even your own boat. Prizes, awards and refreshments follow the race. 
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